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Abstract 
Development of human brain is the essential process in the prenatal period of human growth. The total surface of human brain area is 

1820 cm2, and the average cortical thickness is 2.7 mm. We reviewed and referred to several articles in this field. Comparative studies 

of the primate's brain show that there are general architectural basis governing the brain growth and evolutionary development. In this 

study, it is discussed about the human brain development with highlighting on the main mechanisms in the embryonic stage and early 

postnatal life as well as the general architectural values in brain evolution from primates to now. It is suggested that neurodevelopment 

involves some genetic bases in the neural stem cells proliferation, cortical neurons migration, cerebral cortex folding, synaptogenesis, 

gliogenesis, and myelination of neural fibers.  
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1. Introduction  
Studies of the mammal’s brain express that there are 

general principles governing its evolutionary 
development and growth (Figure 1). The purpose of this 
review is to collect and discuss about views on the 
primate brain development in humans as well as some 

hypothetical principles that underlie the intricate 
organization of the brain.  

Some physical limits pressured its evolutionary 
potential and processing power. For example although a 
brain volume about 3500 cm3, equivalent to a brain size 
two to three times of modern man, looks to reach its 
great processing capacity, but growing beyond the 
critical size, makes the brain less efficient (1, 2). 

 
 



 A Review on Brain Evolution and Development  Fatemeh Tahmasebi, et al 

 

138 

 

Fig. 1. Human brain evolution steps. Upper row is a superior view and lower row is a lateral view of the brain in the 
five species. 

 
2. Human brain evolution   
The human brain has about 100 billion neurons, 

more than 100,000 km of interconnections, and an 
estimated storage capacity of 1.25 × 1012 bytes (3). The 
boundary to any intelligent system lies in its abilities to 
process and integrate large volumes of sensory 
information and to compare these signals with as 
numerous memory states as possible, and all that in a 
minimum of time (4). It implies that the practical 
capacity of a neuronal structure is inherently limited by 
its neural architecture and signal processing time (5, 6). 
The average adult modern human brain has a volume of 
1350 cm3, a total surface area of 1820 cm2, and an 
average cortical thickness of 2.7 mm (7, 8). 

Each cortical neuron has 7000 synapse with other 
neurons on routine, bring a total of 0.15 quadrillion 
synapses and more than 150,000 km of myelinated nerve 
fibers (9, 10). A magnetic resonance imaging (MRI) 
study, furthermore, focusing predominantly on the 
prefrontal cortex, has displayed that the volume of the 
humans white matter underlying prefrontal areas is 
bigger than the other primates (11). It advises that the 
connectional elaboration of the prefrontal cortex, which 
mediates such significant behavioral domains as 
planning, aspects of language, attention, and temporal 

and social information processing has played a vital role 
in human brain development (12).  

During development, the human frontal lobe didn’t 
extend, as some areas with important functional 
correlates are either bigger or smaller in the human brain 
than expected when compared with the same area in 
great apes (13, 14). The mammalian brain varies 
meaningfully in the size, shape, and convolutional 
complexity, but only marginally in the cortical thickness 
(15). In a study on anthropoid primates, 
neuroanatomical information was used to examination 
the following hypotheses: (1) the neocortex of human is 
significantly larger than anticipated for a primate of 
human brain size, (2) the human prefrontal cortex is 
meaningfully more convoluted than expected for the 
human brain size, and (3) increase in white matter 
volume of cerebra gets better results from increases in 
neocortical gray matter volume between anthropoid 
primates. The results of this study showed that human 
brain volume almost tripled in the hominid lineage by 
demonstrating that the neocortex was modified 
throughout hominid development (16, 17). 

3. White matter 
The comparative white matter volume raises with the 

brain size, from 9% in pygmy marmosets (Cebuella 
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pygmaea) to about 35% in humans, the highest value in 
primates (18). The model predicts a white matter volume 
of about 1470 cm3 for an anthropoid primate that has a 
brain volume of 3000 cm3 (19). The ratio of white matter 
rises with brain size, from 22% in a monkey brain of 100 
cm3 to about 65% in a hypothetical primate with a brain 
size of 10,000 cm3 (20). These comparative analyses 
indicate that the evolutionary process of 
neocorticalization in primates is chiefly due to the 
progressive growth of the axonal mass that accomplish 
universal communication, rather than to the rise in the 
cortical neurons number and the significance of high 
neural connectivity in the evolution of brain size in 
anthropoid primates (21). 

 
4. Gray matter 
The volume of cortical gray matter which is 

expressed as a percentage of total brain volume, 
increases from about 25% for the insectivores to 50% 
for humans (22). On the other hand, the relative size of 
the cerebellum remains persistent across phylogenetic 
groups, occupying about 10–15% of the total brain mass 
(23). Human brains are twice as large as chimpanzee 
brains from in 16 weeks of pregnancy already. Although 
both the humans and chimpanzee show an increase in 
growth speed at this time, but they diverge abruptly at 
22 weeks of gestation, when accelerate the human brain 
growth, while decelerates the chimpanzee brain growth. 
Finally, during early infancy, humans experience a very 
fast increase in white matter volume that significantly 
exceeds it in chimpanzees (24). 

4.1. Folding in the cortex 
Differences in the duration of neurogenesis, which 

increases more quickly with the brain size for the 
cerebral cortex than for subcortical areas, lead to a 
systematic surge in the ratio of the cortical to the 
subcortical areas (25, 26). Scientists have found that 
cortical folding and connectivity are related across 
species and a simple model based on a white matter-
based mechanism may reason for increased cortical 
folding in the primate cerebral cortex (27-29). They 
recommend that the degree of tension which is related 
to the morphological features of the fibers (i.e., axonal 

length, its mean cross-sectional area, and the proportion 
of efferent neurons), controls how much the cortical 
surface folds inwards (30).  

The folding of the cortex (gyrification or formation 
of Gyrus) is detected as a tool to boost the number of 
brain cortical neurons; intracranial pressure is 
recognized as a main regulator of the brain development 
(31). Formation of Gyrus begins in the parieto-occipital 
and central sulci at the week of 24 (32). Through term, 
the secondary sulci spread concentrically around the 
primary sulci. After term, tertiary sulci grow together 
with short association fibers (33). Gyrification typically 
begins somewhat earlier in the right hemisphere than the 
left. The expansion of the cortex is a chief regulator of 
the brain folding (12). 

 
5. The Relationship between Neanderthal brain 

size and the evolution of human life history 
The primary postnatal brain growth degree of 

anatomically modern H. sapiens (AMHS) and 
Neanderthals compared to chimpanzees is about double 
rise of endocranial volume (ECV) during the 1st year of 
the life. Rates of postnatal brain growth which have 
developed in H. erectus, makes the hypothesis of the 
beginnings of “modern” human-like patterns of brain 
growth and life history, which must be sought 
comparatively early during the evolution of the genus 
Homo (34). The Neanderthal brain growth pattern fits 
into the hypermorphosis pattern; compared with the 
recent populations of anatomically modern H. sapiens 
(rAMHS), Neanderthals have been shown to reach 
larger cranial sizes and more shapes, which are 
progressive within a given period of ontogenetic time 
(35). Rate hypermorphosis might be an associate of 
greater average body size in Neanderthals compared 
with rAMHS, causing brain size reduction in AMHS 
during the late Pleistocene (36). Otherwise, brain size 
reduction during the Late Pleistocene could be the result 
of an evolutionary presentation optimization (37). Proof 
for the substantial cerebral reorganization comes from 
Late Pleistocene AMHS and Neanderthals, which had 
larger cerebral hemispheres relative to cerebellum 
volume than modern humans (Figure 2) (38, 39). 
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Fig. 2. Brain and skull evolution in chimpanzees, Homo erectus, and Homo sapiens. 
 
6. Effective factors on the human brain evolution 
Recent comparative genomic studies have 

recognized a number of mutations in the modern human 
genome that could underlie the evolution of larger brain 
size (40). For instance, a deletion of one enhancer of the 
growth arrest and a DNA-damage-inducible gamma 
(GADD45G) gene, which leads to brain size expansion, 
is joint with Neanderthals (41). A human-specific 
duplication of a shortened version of the gene SLIT-
ROBO Rho GTPase activating protein 2 (SRGAP2) is 
anticipated to increase dendritic spine density in the 
cortex and could have improved signal processing in the 
hominin brains (42). It is also valued noting that 
Neanderthals, the extinct hominin species that diverged 
from the human evolutionary lineages 400–800 (kya), 
differ from other primates by the same two amino acid 
changes as modern humans in the gene encoding 
forkhead box P2 (FOXP2) (43). 

7. Limits to the Human Brain Evolution 
Descriptions for the evolution of the human brain are 

mostly focusing on the selection pressures of the 
physical environment (climate, diet, food availability) 
and those of the social environment (group size, 
coalition formation, parental care) (44). In fact, there are 
numerals of related factors that interact to limit brain 
size, factors that can be divided into two categories: 1) 
energetic constraints and 2) neural processing 
constraints (3). 

 
8. Limits to Information Processing 
The limit to any neural system is in its ability to 

process and integrate large amounts of information in a 
least of time (45). The development of the cortex does 
appear to coordinate folding with connectivity in a way 
that could create smaller and faster brains. The fastest 
axons have transmission times of 1–5 ms across the 
neocortex and <1 ms from the eye to the brain, large 
brains reduce conduction delays and metabolic firing 
costs at the expense of increased volume. Primates with 
very large brains (e.g., over 5 kg) may have a decreasing 
capability for neuronal integration despite their larger 
number of cortical neurons (46). 

9. Energetic Limits 
The human brain produces about 15 watts (W) in a 

well-insulated cavity of about 1500 cm3. From an 
engineering point of view, removal of sufficient heat to 
prevent thermal overload could be an important problem 
(1). However, the brain is actively cooled by blood and 
not basically by heat conduction from the surface of the 
head. It has been suggested by researchers that the 
evolution of a “cranial radiator” in hominids aided 
providing additional cooling systems. It means that 
natural selection activates on brain size at the cost of 
growth and reproduction, which could clarify its 
connection with the life span (47). On the other hand, 
great brains are energetically costly, and humans expend 
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a larger amount of their energy budget on brain 
metabolism than other primates (48). Paleontological 
evidence shows that rapid brain evolution occurred with 
the emergence of Homo erectus 1.8 million years ago, 
and was associated with vital changes in diet, body size, 
and foraging behavior (49). 

 

10. Human brain development 
Based on biological studies, three different phases 

contribute to the differential growth: neuronal division 
and migration, neuronal connectivity, and 
synaptogenesis and synaptic pruning (50). Growth and 
folding of the cerebral hemispheres during the fetal life 
was shown in Figure 3. 

 

Fig. 3. Growth and folding of the cerebral hemispheres during the fetal life 
 
10.1. The first phase of the brain development 

extents throughout the first half of gestation and is 
characterized by the creation of new neurons at rates of 
up to 250,000 neurons per minute followed by their 
migration toward the outer brain surface (51). 

10.2. The second phase extents from mid-gestation 
throughout 2 years postnatal and is dominated by the 
formation of neuronal connectivity. The new 
connections induce an extreme tangential expansion of 
the outer cortex and the cortex begins to fold and at the 
same time, myelination induces extreme white matter 
growth (52). During the second half of gestation, axons 
extend branches to numerous cortical and subcortical 
targets until each neuron links with thousands of other 
neurons (50). The most important connective structure 
in the human brain is the corpus callosum, a bundle of 
more than 200 million contralateral axons, which 
connect the left and right cerebral hemispheres (53). 

10.3. The third phase extents throughout the entire 
lifetime and is associated with mild synaptogenesis, the 
formation of a few new connections, mostly with 
synaptic pruning, and the removal of unnecessary 
neuronal structures (54). Throughout this phase, the 

human cortex remains plastic, locally adapts its 
thickness, dynamically modifies its stress state, and 
undergoes secondary and tertiary folding (55). 
Synaptogenesis which contributes to the greater 
capacity of the human brain to learn and adapt, contains 
three phases: first, immature synapses form between 
axons and dendrites; then, synapses undergo maturation 
and convert from a quiet to an active state; and finally, 
the synaptic number is reduced to enhance the neuronal 
connections within the circuit (56). In humans, synaptic 
pruning, the process of synapse elimination, starts 
proximate the time of birth and is completed by the time 
of sexual maturation (57). 

11. Role of Glial Cells in the Brain Developing  
Astrocytes, a type of glial cells in the central nervous 

system, play a very important role in synaptic 
transmission and information processing (58, 59). 
Human astrocytes are larger and structurally more 
complex. The ratio of astrocytes to neurons increases 
with cognitive skills and significantly varies between 
species and is 1.4 to 1 in humans (60). The first 
oligodendrocyte progenitor cells are produced in the 
ventricular and subventricular zones about week 10, and 
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their formation extents a peak around week 15 (61, 62). 
They form a myelin sheath around the axon to enable 
rapid impulse propagation. In humans, myelination 
mostly occurs after birth, when neuronal migration has 
ceased and primary and secondary folds have formed 
(63). Microglial cells help to neuronal proliferation and 
differentiation, clear debris, and remodel the synapses 
(64). 

 
Conclusion 

We provided an overview about the cellular, 
molecular, and genetic basis of brain development and 
evolution in the species from the primates to modern 
humans, highlighting the major efficient mechanisms in 
the normal neural development in the embryonic stage 
and early postnatal human life. In addition, we discussed 
about the role of effective factors and limitations related 
to the human brain evolution. The functional system of 
the brain benefits from the high synaptic connectivity 
and short transmission delays. Anatomical differences, 
which are observed between the human and the 
chimpanzee brains and the morphological properties in 
their skulls, present a general image of the evolutionary 
stages that led to the modern form of the human brain 
with high cognitive abilities. 
Acknowledgments 

Nil  
Conflict of interest 

The authors have no conflict of interest in this study. 
 
References 
  1. Hofman MA. Evolution of the human brain: when bigger 

is better. Front Neuroanat 2014;8:15. 

2. Godfrey RK, Gronenberg W. Brain evolution in social 

insects: advocating for the comparative approach. J Comp 

Physiol A 2019;205(1):13-32. 

3. Hofman MA. Design principles of the human brain: an 

evolutionary perspective.  Progress in brain research. 195: 

Elsevier; 2012. p. 373-90. 

4. King J-R, Pescetelli N, Dehaene S. Brain mechanisms 

underlying the brief maintenance of seen and unseen 

sensory information. Neuron 2016;92(5):1122-34. 

5. Avena-Koenigsberger A, Misic B, Sporns O. 

Communication dynamics in complex brain networks. 

Nat Rev Neurosci 2018;19(1):17-33. 

6. Buzsáki G, Logothetis N, Singer W. Scaling brain size, 

keeping timing: evolutionary preservation of brain 

rhythms. Neuron 2013;80(3):751-64. 

7. Badsha F, Dahmann C. A comparative study of 

neocortical development between humans and great apes. 

Technische Universität Dresden; 2017. 

8. He Z, Han D, Efimova O, Guijarro P, Yu Q, Oleksiak A, 

et al. Comprehensive transcriptome analysis of 

neocortical layers in humans, chimpanzees and 

macaques. Nat Neurosci 2017;20(6):886-95. 

9. Nyengaard J, Regeur L. Aging and the human neocortex. 

Exp Gerontol 2003;38:9599. 

10. Timmler S, Simons M. Grey matter myelination. Glia 

2019. 

11. Schoenemann PT, Sheehan MJ, Glotzer LD. Prefrontal 

white matter volume is disproportionately larger in 

humans than in other primates. Nat Neurosci 

2005;8(2):242-52. 

12. Wang JX, Kurth-Nelson Z, Kumaran D, Tirumala D, 

Soyer H, Leibo JZ, et al. Prefrontal cortex as a meta-

reinforcement learning system. Nat Neurosci 

2018;21(6):860. 

13. Semendeferi K, Damasio H. The brain and its main 

anatomical subdivisions in living hominoids using 

magnetic resonance imaging. J Hum Evol 

2000;38(2):317-32. 

14. Teffer K, Semendeferi K. Human prefrontal cortex: 

evolution, development, and pathology.  Progress in brain 

research. 195: Elsevier; 2012. p. 191-218. 

15. Comparative Mammalian Brain Collections [Internet]. 

[cited 2022 May 30]. Available from: 

https://brainmuseum.org/. 

16. Heuer K, Gulban OF, Bazin P-L, Osoianu A, Valabregue 

R, Santin M, et al. Evolution of neocortical folding: A 

phylogenetic comparative analysis of MRI from 34 

primate species. Cortex 2019;118:275-91. 

17. Bryant KL, Preuss TM. A comparative perspective on the 

human temporal lobe. Digital Endocasts: Springer; 2018. 

p. 239-58. 



 A Review on Brain Evolution and Development  Fatemeh Tahmasebi, et al 

 

143 

18. Hofman MA. The fractal geometry of the human brain: 

an evolutionary perspective. The Fractal Geometry of the 

Brain: Springer; 2016. p. 169-86. 

19. Briggs JA, Wolvetang EJ, Mattick JS, Rinn JL, Barry G. 

Mechanisms of long non-coding RNAs in mammalian 

nervous system development, plasticity, disease, and 

evolution. Neuron 2015;88(5):861-77. 

20. Hofman MA. Neural Networks and Cognition An 

Evolutionary Approach. Jap J Cogn Neurosci 2008;10(3-

4):235-8. 

21.  Falk D, Gibson K. Evolutionary Anatomy of the Primate 

Cerebral Cortex [Internet]. [cited 2022 May 30]. 

Available from: 

https://www.cambridge.org/core/books/evolutionary-

anatomy-of-the-primate-cerebral-

cortex/BBF4FC928BB753724B560F7B1C51E893 

22. de Lussanet MH. Comment on “Cortical folding scales 

universally with surface area and thickness, not number 

of neurons”. Science 2015;349(6243):74-7. 

23. Herculano-Houzel S. Neuronal scaling rules for primate 

brains: the primate advantage.   Prog Brain Res 

2012;195:325-40. 

24. Sakai T, Matsui M, Mikami A, Malkova L, Hamada Y, 

Tomonaga M, et al. Developmental patterns of 

chimpanzee cerebral tissues provide important clues for 

understanding the remarkable enlargement of the human 

brain. Proceedings of the Royal Society B: Bio Sci 

2013;280(1753):20122398. 

25. Finlay BL, Darlington RB, Nicastro N. Developmental 

structure in brain evolution. Behav Brain Sci 

2001;24(2):263-78. 

26. Charvet CJ, Finlay BL. Embracing covariation in brain 

evolution: large brains, extended development, and 

flexible primate social systems. Prog Brain Res 

2012;195:71-87. 

27. Herculano-Houzel S, Mota B, Wong P, Kaas JH. 

Connectivity-driven white matter scaling and folding in 

primate cerebral cortex. Proc Natl Acad Sci 

2010;107(44):19008-13. 

28. Mota B, Herculano-Houzel S. How the cortex gets its 

folds: an inside-out, connectivity-driven model for the 

scaling of mammalian cortical folding. Front Neuroanat 

2012;6:3. 

29. Ribeiro PF, Ventura-Antunes L, Gabi M, Mota B, 

Grinberg LT, Farfel JM, et al. The human cerebral cortex 

is neither one nor many: neuronal distribution reveals two 

quantitatively different zones in the gray matter, three in 

the white matter, and explains local variations in cortical 

folding. Front Neuroanat 2013;7:28. 

30. Budday S, Sommer G, Birkl C, Langkammer C, 

Haybaeck J, Kohnert J, et al. Mechanical characterization 

of human brain tissue. Acta Biomater 2017;48:319-40. 

31. Zilles K, Palomero-Gallagher N, Amunts K. 

Development of cortical folding during evolution and 

ontogeny. Trends Neurosci 2013;36(5):275-84. 

32. Takahashi E, Folkerth RD, Galaburda AM, Grant PE. 

Emerging cerebral connectivity in the human fetal brain: 

an MR tractography study. Cereb cortex 2011;22(2):455-

64. 

33. Ballabh P, Braun A, Nedergaard M. Anatomic analysis of 

blood vessels in germinal matrix, cerebral cortex, and 

white matter in developing infants. Pediatr Res 

2004;56(1):117. 

34. Leigh SR. Brain ontogeny and life history in Homo 

erectus. J Hum Evol 2006;50(1):104. 

35. Lesciotto KM, Richtsmeier JT. Craniofacial skeletal 

response to encephalization: How do we know what we 

think we know? Am J Phys Anthropol 2019;168:27-46. 

36. Li Z-Y, Wu X-J, Zhou L-P, Liu W, Gao X, Nian X-M, et 

al. Late Pleistocene archaic human crania from Xuchang, 

China. Science 2017;355(6328):969-72. 

37. Gómez-Robles A, Smaers JB, Holloway RL, Polly PD, 

Wood BA. Brain enlargement and dental reduction were 

not linked in hominin evolution. Proceedings of the Nat 

Acad Sci 2017;114(3):468-73. 

38. Albessard L, Grimaud-Hervé D, Balzeau A. Evolution of 

cranial and endocranial profiles in Homo species: A study 

in 2D geometric morphometrics. Bull Mem Soc 

Anthropol Paris 2016;28(3-4):118-31. 

39. Tahmasebi F, Khanehzad M, Madadi S, Hassanzadeh G. 

Anthropometric study of nasal parameters in Iranian 

University Students. Anat Sci Int 2015;12(4):167-70. 

40. Florio M, Namba T, Pääbo S, Hiller M, Huttner WB. A 

single splice site mutation in human-specific 

ARHGAP11B causes basal progenitor amplification. Sci 

Adv 2016;2(12):e1601941. 



 A Review on Brain Evolution and Development  Fatemeh Tahmasebi, et al 

 

144 

41. Florio M, Heide M, Pinson A, Brandl H, Albert M, 

Winkler S, et al. Evolution and cell-type specificity of 

human-specific genes preferentially expressed in 

progenitors of fetal neocortex. Elife 2018;7:e32332. 

42. Hofman MA. Evolution of the human brain: from matter 

to mind.  Handbook of Intelligence: Springer; 2015. p. 65-

82. 

43. Somel M, Liu X, Khaitovich P. Human brain evolution: 

transcripts, metabolites and their regulators. Nat Rev 

Neurosci 2013;14(2):112. 

44. Janson CH. Evolutionary ecology of primate social 

structure.  Evol Hum Behav 2017;130:95-130. 

45. Petersen A. Brain Maturation and Cognitive 

Development: Comparative and Cross-cultural 

Perspectives. Taylor & Francis; 2017. 472. 

46. Hasson U, Chen J, Honey CJ. Hierarchical process 

memory: memory as an integral component of 

information processing. Trends Cogn Sci 

2015;19(6):304-13. 

47. Leigh SR. Brain growth, life history, and cognition in 

primate and human evolution. Am J Primatol 

2004;62(3):139-64. 

48. Leonard WR. Brain growth. The International 

Encyclopedia of Biological Anthropology. 2018:1-4. 

49. Leonard WR, Snodgrass JJ, Robertson ML. Effects of 

brain evolution on human nutrition and metabolism. 

Annu Rev Nutr 2007;27:311-27. 

50. Raybaud C, Ahmad T, Rastegar N, Shroff M, Al Nassar 

M. The premature brain: developmental and lesional 

anatomy. Neuroradiology 2013;55(2):23-40. 

51. Budday S, Steinmann P, Kuhl E. The role of mechanics 

during brain development. J Mech Phys Solids 

2014;72:75-92. 

52. Vandekar SN, Shinohara RT, Raznahan A, Roalf DR, 

Ross M, DeLeo N, et al. Topologically dissociable 

patterns of development of the human cerebral cortex. J 

Neurosci 2015;35(2):599-609. 

53. Luders E, Thompson PM, Toga AW. The development of 

the corpus callosum in the healthy human brain. J 

Neurosci 2010;30(33):10985-90. 

54. Jamann N, Jordan M, Engelhardt M. Activity-dependent 

axonal plasticity in sensory systems. Neuroscience 

2018;368:268-82. 

55. Budday S, Steinmann P, Kuhl E. Secondary instabilities 

modulate cortical complexity in the mammalian brain. 

Philos Mag 2015;95(28-30):3244-56. 

56. Craig AM, Graf ER, Linhoff MW. How to build a central 

synapse: clues from cell culture. Trends Neurosci 

2006;29(1):8-20. 

57. Atkinson EG. The Genetic Architecture and Evolution of 

Brain Cortical Folding in a Pedigreed Primate Population: 

Washington University; 2013. 

58. Van Horn MR, Ruthazer ES. Glial regulation of synapse 

maturation and stabilization in the developing nervous 

system. Curr Opin Neurobiol 2019;54:113-9. 

59. Barati S, Tahmasebi F, Faghihi F. Effects of 

mesenchymal stem cells transplantation on multiple 

sclerosis patients. Neuropeptides 2020;84:102095. 

60. Nedergaard M, Ransom B, Goldman SA. New roles for 

astrocytes: redefining the functional architecture of the 

brain. Trends Neurosci 2003;26(10):523-30. 

61. Freeman MR. Specification and morphogenesis of 

astrocytes. Science 2010;330(6005):774-8. 

62. Barati S, Kashani IR, Tahmasebi F. The effects of 

mesenchymal stem cells transplantation on A1 neurotoxic 

reactive astrocyte and demyelination in the cuprizone 

model. J Mol Histol 2022:1-14. 

63. Barres BA. The mystery and magic of glia: a perspective 

on their roles in health and disease. Neuron 

2008;60(3):430-40. 

64. Harry GJ. Microglia during development and aging. 

Pharmacol Ther 2013;139(3):313-26.  
        

 

This is an open-access article distributed under the terms of the Creative Commons Attribution-NonCommercial 4.0 International License which permits copy 

and redistribute the material just in noncommercial usages, provided the original work is properly cited. 

 


